

Boyce
HOLLEMAN & ASSOCIATES
A Professional Association Attorneys at Law
Since 1950

Harrison County
 1801 23rd Avenue
 Gulfport, MS 39501

7/27/2017

In Reference To: HCCoroner
 Invoice No: 013337

Williams, et al. vs. Gary Hargrove, Harrison County, et.al;
 Civil Action Number: 1:16-CV-266-HSO-MTP
 Billing period for services rendered from June 1, 2017 through June 30, 2017

Services Rendered

Date	Staff	Description	Hours	Rate	Charges
6/01/2017	TCH	Email and attachment from Mason Re: Evans Deposition; Email from Seawell Re: Documents; Email from Art Re: Same; Email from Art Re: Autopsies; Email from Owen Re: Same	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/01/2017	TCH	Conference, Preparation and Attendance of Deposition of Rocko at Owen's Office	6.00	\$150.00	\$900.00
6/02/2017	TCH	Email from Seawell Re: Discovery; Email and attachment from Mason Re: Dickey and Hartwell Depositions; Email from Seawell Re: Plaintiffs' Executed HIPAA Waivers; Email from Seawell Re: Discovery; Email from Art Re: Marshall Tax Returns (x2); Email from Seawell Re: Same; Email and attachment from Mason Re: L. August Exhibits; Email and attachment from Mason Re: Rockco Exhibits; Email from Grusin Re: Deposition Schedule; Multiple emails to and from Webster Re: Assurance Contract; Email to and from TT Re: Same	1.40	\$150.00	\$210.00

\$877.00
7/17

Jesse Boyce Holleman
1924-2003

Tim C. Holleman
tim@boyceholleman.com

L. Dean Holleman
dean@boyceholleman.com

Patrick T. Guild
patrick@boyceholleman.com

Tricia S. Tisdale
tricia@boyceholleman.com

6/04/2017	TCH	Email and attachment to Counsel Re: Assurance Contract	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/05/2017	TCH	Email and attachment from Mason Re: Rockco Deposition; Email and attachment from Mason Re: L. August Deposition; Multiple Emails to and from Seawell Re: Discovery	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/06/2017	TCH	Email to and from Ulrich Re: Deposition; Email to and from Seawell Re: Tax Returns	0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00
6/07/2017	TCH	Email from Seawell Re: Hargrove Deposition	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/07/2017	TCH	Preparation and Attendance of Deposition of A. Marshall at Owen's Office; Conference with Hargrove and Owen	7.00	\$150.00	\$1,050.00
6/08/2017	TCH	Email and attachment to Owen and Seawell Re: Case Law; Research; Email to and from Yates Re: Assurance; Email to Riemann Re: Assurance; Email to Owen and Seawell Re: Same; Multiple Emails and attachments from Riemann Re: Documents	1.20	\$150.00	\$180.00
6/08/2017	TCH	Preparation and Attendance of Deposition of Hargrove at Owen's Office	9.00	\$150.00	\$1,350.00
6/09/2017	TCH	Conference with Webster	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
6/09/2017	TCH	Email to and from Webster Re: Bids; Email and attachment to Forbes Re: Same	0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00
6/12/2017	TCH	Multiple emails and attachments from Seawell Re: Discovery; Multiple emails from Grusin Re: Same	0.60	\$150.00	\$90.00
6/13/2017	TCH	Email from Art Re: Expert Disclosures and Production of Files; Email from Art Re: Plaintiffs Tax Returns; Email and attachment from Seawell Re: Discovery; Email from Pfander Re: Same	0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00
6/14/2017	TCH	Email to Grusin Re: Deposition	0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00

		Availability; Email and attachment from Seawell Re: Discovery; Email from Pfander Re: Same; Email and attachment from Schroeder Re: Deposition of A. Marshall			
6/15/2017	TCH	Email and attachments from Pfander Re: Additional Plaintiff's Tax Documents; Review Tax Documents; Email and attachment from Pfander Re: Document Production	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/16/2017	TCH	Email to and from Thrash Re: Documents; Review the Same	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/17/2017	TCH	Email and attachment from Schroeder Re: Hargrove Deposition; Email to Seawell Re: Status, Contract; Email to and from Riemann Re: Assurance	0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00
6/19/2017	TCH	Email from Seawell Re: Autopsies; Email from Seawell Re: Status; Email from Seawell Re: Statistical Analysis Expert; Email and attachment from Seawell Re: Autopsies Report	0.40	\$150.00	\$60.00
6/20/2017	TCH	Email and attachment from Pfander Re: US Census Bureau Documents; Email and attachment from Riemann Re: Assurance Contract	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00
6/21/2017	TCH	Preparation of Letter to Secretary of State Re: Public Records Request; Email to and from Seawell Re: Same; Email Seawell Re: Status; Multiple emails to and from Seawell Re: McGarry	0.90	\$150.00	\$135.00
6/22/2017	TCH	Conference with Seawells Re: Status	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
6/22/2017	TCH	Multiple emails to and from Grusin and Lovey Re: Marshall's Concrete Enclosure	0.30	\$150.00	\$45.00
6/26/2017	TCH	Email from Seawell Re: Discovery; Multiple emails to and from Art Re: Schedule, Production Deadline Extension; Email to and from Art Re: Opinions; Email to and from Art Re: Filing Motion; Email and attachments from Pfander Re: Tax Documents	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00

6/28/2017	TCH	Email from Seawell Re: Discovery	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/28/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Extend Deadline for Expert Discovery	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/28/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Appear Pro Hac Vice for Roche	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00

Total Fees \$5,160.00

Expenses

<u>Start Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Charges</u>
6/08/2017	Lexis Nexis Research	1.00	\$25.65

Total Expenses \$25.65

Amount Due This Invoice

\$5,185.65

Staff Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Tim C Holleman	34.40	\$150.00

