

Boyce
HOLLEMAN & ASSOCIATES
A Professional Association Attorneys at Law
Since 1950

Harrison County
 1801 23rd Avenue
 Gulfport, MS 39501

7/27/2017

In Reference To: HCPorter, Keith
 Invoice No: 013338

Keith La-Dale Porter vs. Harrison County, et.al;
 Civil Action Number: 1:16-cv-69-LG-RHW
 Billing period for services rendered from April 22, 2017 through June 30, 2017

Services Rendered

Date	Staff	Description	Hours	Rate	Charges
5/03/2017	PTG	Preparation of Answer to Interrogatories and Notice of Service of Same (Porter 1)	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
5/04/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice of Appearance by Charles Cowan obo CMA (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/11/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice for Porter (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/11/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice for Porter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/11/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Affidavit of John Minter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/12/2017	PTG	Telephone conference with Norris Hopkins Re: Pleadings (Porter 2)	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00
5/17/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Strike Affidavit of John Minter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/19/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Response in Support of Motion to Compel (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00

Boyd
 7/27/17

Jesse Boyce Holleman
 1924-2003

Tim C. Holleman
 tim@boyceholleman.com

L. Dean Holleman
 dean@boyceholleman.com

Patrick T. Guild
 patrick@boyceholleman.com

Tricia S. Tisdale
 tricia@boyceholleman.com

5/19/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Compel Discovery (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/22/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice for Porter (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/22/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Status of Motion to Compel (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
5/22/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Appoint Expert by Porter (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/05/2017	TCH	Reviewed Complaint (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/05/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Memorandum in Support of Affidavit re Complaint (Porter2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/12/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Affidavit of Indigency (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/12/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Affidavit of Indigency (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/12/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Response in Opposition to MSJ (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/12/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion of Evidence in Support of Civil Action (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/14/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Amend/Correct by Porter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/15/2017	PTG	Telephone Conference with Charles Cowan Re: Motions and Pleadings (Porter 1)	0.20	\$150.00	\$30.00
6/15/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Amended Complaint by Porter	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/19/2017	PTG	Preparation of Motion to Strike Plaintiff's Affidavit and Memorandum in Support (Porter 2)	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/20/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice for Porter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/20/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Order Granting Motion to Strike dkt 35, Deny Motion to	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00

Amend, Grant Motion to Strike dkt 37
&38 (Porter 2)

Date	Staff	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
6/20/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Notice for Porter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/22/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Statement of Disputed Factual Issues by Porter (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/26/2017	PTG	Preparation of Motion to Strike Sur-Rebuttals for Motion for Summary Judgment (Porter 1)	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/26/2017	PTG	Preparation of Motion to Strike Amended Complaint (Porter 1)	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
6/26/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Strike dkt 13, 134, 133 by CMA (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/29/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Affidavit by Porter (Porter 2)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/29/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Letter to Clerk from Porter re Filings (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/29/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Motion to Strike Amended Complaint by CMA (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00
6/30/2017	TCH	Received and Reviewed Joinder in dkt 130, 134, 133, 143, 135, 141, 140 by Stieler (Porter 1)	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00

Total Fees \$840.00

Amount Due This Invoice

\$840.00

Staff Summary

Name	Hours	Rate
Patrick T Guild	2.90	\$150.00
Tim C Holleman	2.70	\$150.00